

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Service Saddles
 FOR: (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 15, 2016

Fortiline
 3011 North Pan Am Expy
 San Antonio, TX 78219

Morrison Supply Co.
 10850 Leslie Rd.
 Helotes, TX 78023

Ferguson Waterworks
 4427 Factory Hill
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Act Pipe & Supply
 4719 Dodge Street
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Corix Water Products
 222 Park 35 Cove North
 Buda, TX 78610

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY						
GROUP I	SERVICE SADDLES FOR DUCTILE IRON & A/C PIPE						
	15 ea. (SAWS #15549)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 4" x 3/4" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40	PRICE	63.95	65.02	64.40	64.12	65.71
	with stainless steel straps	TOTAL	959.25	975.30	966.00	961.80	985.65
1.	Make		Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-5.40 XIP 3			James Jones J969
	15 ea. (SAWS #15547)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 4" x 1" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40	PRICE	63.95	65.02	64.40	64.12	65.71
	with stainless steel straps	TOTAL	959.25	975.30	966.00	961.80	985.65
2.	Make		Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS - 5.40 XIP 4			James Jones J969
	15 ea. (SAWS #15511)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 4" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40	PRICE	74.59	75.84	75.92	75.61	76.70
	with stainless steel straps	TOTAL	1,118.85	1,137.60	1,138.80	1,134.15	1,150.50
3.	Make		Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-540-IP6			James Jones J969
	50 ea. (SAWS #15548)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 4" x 2" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40,	PRICE	77.13	78.42	77.70	78.47	78.47
	material w/stainless steel straps	TOTAL	3,856.50	3,921.00	3,885.00	3,923.50	3,923.50
4.	Make		Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS - 540 - IP7			James Jones J969
	125 ea. (SAWS #15514)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 6" x 3/4" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35,	PRICE	75.32	76.58	75.85	76.62	76.61
	w/stainless steel straps	TOTAL	9,415.00	9,572.50	9,481.25	9,577.50	9,576.25
5.	Make		Ford 202BS	Ford 202BS-750-IP3			James Jones J969
	50 ea. (SAWS #15555)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 6" x 3/4" IP, Range B 6.90-7.45,	PRICE	63.78	64.85	65.50	66.13	66.82
	material w/bale straps	TOTAL	3,189.00	3,242.50	3,275.00	3,306.50	3,341.00
6.	Make		Ford 202BS	Ford 202B-750-IP4			James Jones J979
	50 ea. (SAWS #15551)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35	PRICE	75.32	76.58	75.85	75.84	77.41
	w/stainless steel straps	TOTAL	3,766.00	3,829.00	3,792.50	3,792.00	3,870.50
7.	Make		Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-750-IP4			James Jones J969
	30 ea. (SAWS #15550)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1" IP, Range B 6.90-7.45,	PRICE	63.78	64.85	65.50	65.19	66.82
	w/bale straps, material bronze	TOTAL	1,913.40	1,945.50	1,965.00	1,955.70	2,004.60
8.	Make		Ford 202B	Ford 202 B-750-IP4			James Jones J979
	25 ea. (SAWS #15513)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35,	PRICE	86.11	87.55	86.82	86.36	87.60
	w/stainless steel straps	TOTAL	2,152.75	2,188.75	2,170.50	2,159.00	2,190.00
9.	Make		Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-750-IP6			James Jones J969
	15 ea. (SAWS #15512)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1-1/2" IP, Range B 6.90-7.45,	PRICE	72.92	74.13	74.85	74.54	75.61
	material w/bale straps	TOTAL	1,093.80	1,111.95	1,122.75	1,118.10	1,134.15
10.	Make		Ford 202B	Ford 202 B-750-IP6			James Jones J979
	50 ea. (SAWS #15553)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 6" x 2" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35,	PRICE	89.89	91.39	90.55	90.15	91.45
	material w/stainless steel straps	TOTAL	4,494.50	4,569.50	4,527.50	4,507.50	4,572.50
11.	Make		Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-750-IP7			James Jones J969
	50 ea. (SAWS #15554)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 6" x 2" IP, Range B 7.35-7.75,	PRICE	80.13	81.46	82.30	82.29	83.13
	material w/bale straps	TOTAL	4,006.50	4,073.00	4,115.00	4,114.50	4,156.50
12.	Make		Ford 202B	Ford 202 B-750-IP7			James Jones J979
	100 ea. (SAWS #15562)	UNIT					
	Saddle, Service, size 8" x 3/4" IP, Range A 9.00-9.56	PRICE	93.24	94.79	93.88	94.84	94.83
	w/stainless steel straps	TOTAL	9,324.00	9,479.00	9,388.00	9,484.00	9,483.00
13.	Make		Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-962-IP3			James Jones J969

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Service Saddles
 FOR: (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 15, 2016

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Fortiline
 3011 North Pan Am Expy
 San Antonio, TX 78219

Morrison Supply Co.
 10850 Leslie Rd.
 Helotes, TX 78023

Ferguson Waterworks
 4427 Factory Hill
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Act Pipe & Supply
 4719 Dodge Street
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Corix Water Products
 222 Park 35 Cove North
 Buda, TX 78610

14.	50 ea. (SAWS #15563) Saddle, Service, size 8" x 3/4" IP, Range B 8.99-9.57 w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	78.94 3,947.00	80.26 4,013.00	81.05 4,052.50	80.71 4,035.50	81.87 4,093.50
			Ford 202B	Ford 202B-962-IP3			James Jones J979
15.	5 ea. (SAWS #15558) Saddle, Service, size 8" x 1" IP, Range B 8.63-9.62 w/bale steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	78.94 394.70	80.26 401.30	81.05 405.25	80.71 403.55	81.87 409.35
			Ford 202B	Ford 202 B-962-IP4			James Jones J979
16.	50 ea. (SAWS #15557) Saddle, Service, size 8" x 1" IP, Range A 8.63-9.62, w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	93.24 4,662.00	94.79 4,739.50	93.90 4,695.00	93.49 4,674.50	94.83 4,741.50
			Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-962-IP4			James Jones J969
17.	10 ea. (SAWS #15556) Saddle, Service, size 8" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 8.63 - 9.62, w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	98.13 981.30	99.78 997.80	98.85 988.50	98.42 984.20	98.82 988.20
			Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-962-IP6			James Jones J969
18.	10 ea. (SAWS #15515) Saddle, Service, size 8" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 8.63 - 9.62, 2/bale straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	83.11 831.10	84.50 845.00	85.35 853.50	84.96 849.60	85.30 853.00
			Ford 202B	Ford 202B-962-IP6			James Jones J979
19.	20 ea. (SAWS #15561) Saddle, Service, size 8" x 2" IP, Range A 9.00-9.56, material w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	101.50 2,030.00	103.20 2,064.00	102.25 2,045.00	103.27 2,065.40	103.26 2,065.20
			Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-962-IP7			James Jones J969
20.	25 ea. (SAWS #15560) Saddle, Service, size 8" x 2" IP, Range B 9.39-9.95 material w/bale straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	90.47 2,261.75	91.98 2,299.50	93.00 2,325.00	92.60 2,315.00	93.93 2,348.25
			Ford 202B	Ford 202 B-962-IP7			James Jones J979
21.	10 ea. (SAWS #15522) Saddle, Service, size 10" x 3/4" IP, Range A 11.10-12.12, w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	115.50 1,155.00	117.44 1,174.40	116.30 1,163.00	115.82 1,158.20	117.49 1,174.90
			Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-1212-IP3			James Jones J969
22.	10 ea. (SAWS #15519) Saddle, Service, size 10" x 1" IP, Range A 11.10-12.12, w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	115.50 1,155.00	117.44 1,174.40	116.30 1,163.00	115.82 1,158.20	117.49 1,174.90
			Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-1212-IP4			James Jones J969
23.	10 ea. (SAWS #15520) Saddle, Service, size 10" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 11.10-12.12, w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	126.85 1,268.50	128.97 1,289.70	127.75 1,277.50	127.22 1,272.20	127.73 1,277.30
			Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-1212-IP6			James Jones J969
24.	10 ea. (SAWS #15521) Saddle, Service, size 10" x 2" IP, Range A 11.05 - 12.00, material w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	129.41 1,294.10	131.57 1,315.70	130.32 1,303.20	129.78 1,297.80	130.30 1,303.00
			Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-1212-IP7			James Jones J969
25.	15 ea. (SAWS #15529) Saddle, Service, size 12" x 3/8" IP, Range A 13.20-14.58, w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	128.42 1,926.30	130.57 1,958.55	129.30 1,939.50	130.63 1,959.45	127.73 1,915.95
			Ford 202BS	Ford 202 BS-1438-IP3			James Jones J969
26.	10 ea. (SAWS #15530) Saddle, Service, Size 12" x 3/4" IP, Range B 14.16-15.16, material w/bale straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	114.45 1,144.50	116.36 1,163.60	117.55 1,175.50	117.53 1,175.30	117.00 1,170.00
			Ford 202B	Ford 202 B-1438-IP3			James Jones J979

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Service Saddles
 FOR: (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 15, 2016

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Fortiline
 3011 North Pan Am Expy
 San Antonio, TX 78219

Morrison Supply Co.
 10850 Leslie Rd.
 Helotes, TX 78023

Ferguson Waterworks
 4427 Factory Hill
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Act Pipe & Supply
 4719 Dodge Street
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Corix Water Products
 222 Park 35 Cove North
 Buda, TX 78610

27.	20 ea. (SAWS #15523) Saddle, Service, size 12" x 1" IP, Range A 13.20-14.38, w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	128.42 2,568.40	130.57 2,611.40	129.30 2,586.00	128.77 2,575.40	129.29 2,585.80	Ford 202BS Ford 202 BS-1438-IP4 James Jones J969
28.	10 ea. (SAWS #15524) Saddle, Service, size 12" x 1" IP, Range B 14.16-15.16, material w/bale straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	114.45 1,144.50	116.36 1,163.60	117.55 1,175.50	117.05 1,170.50	117.53 1,175.30	Ford 202B Ford 202 B-1438-IP4 James Jones J979
29.	10 ea. (SAWS #15525) Saddle, Service, size 12" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 13.20-14.38, w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	144.83 1,448.30	147.25 1,472.50	145.85 1,458.50	145.24 1,452.40	145.83 1,458.30	Ford 202BS Ford 202 BS-1438-IP6 James Jones J969
30.	10 ea. (SAWS #15526) Saddle, Service, size 12" x 1-1/2" IP, Range B 14.16-15.16, material w/bale straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	129.09 1,290.90	131.25 1,312.50	132.60 1,326.00	132.03 1,320.30	132.57 1,325.70	Ford 202B Ford 202 B-1438-IP6 James Jones J979
31.	25 ea. (SAWS #15527) Saddle, Service, size 12" x 2" IP, Range A 13.10 - 14.16, material w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	147.47 3,686.75	149.93 3,748.25	148.50 3,712.50	150.03 3,750.75	148.50 3,712.50	Ford 202BS Ford 202 BS-1438-IP7 James Jones J969
32.	15 ea. (SAWS #15528) Saddle, Service, size 12" x 2" IP, Range B 14.16 - 15.16, material w/bale straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	131.41 1,971.15	133.61 2,004.15	135.00 2,025.00	134.43 2,016.45	136.37 2,045.55	Ford 202B Ford 202 B-1438-IP7 James Jones J979
33.	10 ea. (SAWS #15537) Saddle, Service, size 16" x 3/4" IP, Range A 17.35 - 18.35 w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	331.00 3,310.00	336.53 3,365.30	333.30 3,333.00	331.93 3,319.30	333.28 3,332.80	Ford 202BS Ford 202 BS-1840-IP3 James Jones J969
34.	10 ea. (SAWS #15536) Saddle, Service, size 16" x 3/4" IP, Range B 18.35 - 19.35, material w/bale straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	280.27 2,802.70	284.95 2,849.50	298.05 2,980.50	296.83 2,968.30	298.04 2,980.40	Ford 202B Ford 202 B-1925-IP3 James Jones J979
35.	10 ea. (SAWS #15532) Saddle, Service, size 16" x 1" IP, Range A 17.35 - 18.35, w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	331.00 3,310.00	336.53 3,365.30	333.30 3,333.00	331.93 3,319.30	333.28 3,332.80	Ford 202BS Ford 202 BS-1840-IP4 James Jones J969
36.	10 ea. (SAWS #15534) Saddle, Service, size 16" x 1" IP, Range B 17.40 - 19.19, material w/bale straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	280.27 2,802.70	284.95 2,849.50	298.05 2,980.50	296.83 2,968.30	298.00 2,980.00	Ford 202B Ford 202 B-1925-IP4 James Jones J979
37.	10 ea. (SAWS #15533) Saddle, Service, size 16" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 17.35 - 18.35, material w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	351.22 3,512.20	357.09 3,570.90	353.65 3,536.50	352.18 3,521.80	350.05 3,500.50	Ford 202BS Ford 202 BS-1840-IP6 James Jones J969
38.	10 ea. (SAWS #15504) Saddle, Service, size 16" x 1-1/2" IP, Range B 18.35 - 19.35, material w/bale straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	297.39 2,973.90	302.35 3,023.50	316.25 3,162.50	314.95 3,149.50	313.04 3,130.40	Ford 202B Ford 202 B-1925-IP6 James Jones J979

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Service Saddles
 FOR: (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 15, 2016

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Fortiline
 3011 North Pan Am Expy
 San Antonio, TX 78219

Morrison Supply Co.
 10850 Leslie Rd.
 Helotes, TX 78023

Ferguson Waterworks
 4427 Factory Hill
 San Antonio, TX 78219

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
 13790 Judson Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78233

Act Pipe & Supply
 4719 Dodge Street
 San Antonio, TX 78217

Corix Water Products
 222 Park 35 Cove North
 Buda, TX 78610

39.	10 ea. (SAWS #15531) Saddle, Service, size 16" x 2" IP, Range A 17.35 - 18.35, material w/stainless steel straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	388.15 3,881.50	Ford 202BS	394.63 3,946.30	Ford 202 BS-1840-IP7	382.95 3,829.50	381.36 3,813.60	379.05 3,790.50	James Jones
40.	10 ea. (SAWS #15535) Saddle, Service, size 16" x 2" IP, Range B 18.35 - 19.35, material w/bale straps Make	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	328.63 3,286.30	Ford 202B	334.12 3,341.20	Ford 202 B-1840-IP7	349.50 3,495.00	348.05 3,480.50	346.00 3,460.00	James Jones
				*						
	TOTAL GROUP 1	TOTAL	107,289.35		109,081.25		109,113.75	109,171.35	109,699.40	
	Manufacturer		Ford Brass		Ford		Mueller Model BR25 and BR2B AY McDonald Models 385,638,463,826.00	Mueller	James Jones	
	Price Schedule or Catalog							Net Trade Price	Net Trade Price Sheets	
	Date of Schedule		Rev. Feb. 2016		March 2014			2/11/09	May 31, 2017	
	Percent Discount				40% Off list			35% off List Price	Net	
	EXTENSION 1		107,289.35							
	EXTENSION 2		107,289.35							
	EXTENSION 3		107,289.35							
	Terms		Net 30 days		Net 30 days		Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	
	Delivery Days		10 days		2 weeks		10 days			

NO BID

***LOW BIDDER**

BIDS INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Act Pipe & Supply
 B Wymer
 Corix
 Ferguson Waterworks
 Fortiline
 HD Supply Waterworks
 KLP Commercial
 Morrison Supply
 MS Techline Pipe

Demandstar
 SAWS Website